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NOTIFICATION OF USE OF COPYRIGHT MATERIAL FOR SERVICES OF THE CROWN 

 
To:  Ian Purdie 
From: Curriculum Council, Government of Western Australia 
 
The Curriculum Council is a state government authority with functions which include: 

1. the development and implementation of a curriculum framework for Western 
Australian schools 

2. the development and accreditation of senior secondary courses for Western 
Australian schools 

3. the assessment and certification of Western Australian senior secondary 
students’ achievement. 

In carrying out these functions, the Curriculum Council also produces resources to 
support course teaching and assessment programs, and conducts the Western 
Australian Certificate of Education (WACE) public examinations. 
 
The Curriculum Council uses copyright material under s183 of the Copyright Act 1968 
(Cth), and in some circumstances is required to notify and agree terms with copyright 
owners regarding the use of their work. Please see attached a notice of the use of 
your work on the Curriculum Council website in relation to the Engineering Studies 
course. Your work will be acknowledged, and will be made available on our website at 
http://www.curriculum.wa.edu.au/internet/Senior_Secondary/Courses/WACE_Course
s/Engineering_Studies. Please insert below any comments you wish to make and the 
terms (if any) to which you desire the Curriculum Council to agree, in relation to this 
use of your work. 
 

Please sign below to acknowledge receipt of the notice. 
 

Terms/comments:  

 

 

 

Name (please print):  

Signature:  Date:  
 

Please return completed form to: 
 

Janis Haswell 
Copyright Office 
Curriculum Council 
27 Walters Drive 
OSBORNE PARK  WA  6017 

 
T 61 (0)8 9442 9705 
F 61 (0)8 9273 6301 
E janis.haswell@curriculum.wa.edu.au 
 

2011/12295 



 

Curriculum Council of Western Australia 

 
NOTICE UNDER S183(4) OF THE COPYRIGHT ACT 1968 (CTH) 

 
To:  Ian Purdie,  Purdie, Ian 
From: The State of Western Australia acting through its Curriculum Council, a body 
corporate established by s5 of the Curriculum Council Act 1997 (Western Australia) 
 
Under s183(4) of the Copyright Act 1968 (Cth) the Government of the State of 
Western Australia hereby notifies you, the owner of copyright in the work specified 
below, that the Government of Western Australia intends to communicate this work to 
the public [Copyright Act 1968, s31(1)(a)(iv)] by making it available on the Curriculum 
Council website. 
 
The purpose of this notice is to inform you in pursuance of s183(4) of the Copyright 
Act 1968 of the communication to the public by the Curriculum Council of your work.  
[Copyright Regulations 1969, Regulation 25(5)(f)]. 
 
 

DESCRIPTION OF WORK 

 

Purdie, I. (n.d.). Resistor colour chart. Retrieved January, 2010, from Electronics Tutorials website: 
http://www.electronics-tutorials.com/basics/resistor-color-code.htm. 
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